
Produce Description SKUs DIR Pricing

Subscription upto 128 asset range. This includes 
discovery, unlimited scan engines, unlimited 
templates and up to 3 InsightVM Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $     3,040.00 

Subscription upto 256 asset range. This includes 
discovery, unlimited scan engines, unlimited 
templates and up to 3 InsightVM Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $     6,080.00 

Subscription upto 512 asset range. This includes 
discovery, unlimited scan engines, unlimited 
templates and up to 3 InsightVM Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   10,700.80 

Subscription upto 768 asset range. This includes 
discovery, unlimited scan engines, unlimited 
templates and up to 3 InsightVM Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   14,835.20 
Subscription upto 1,024 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   18,969.60 
Subscription upto 1,536 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   25,779.20 
Subscription upto 2,048 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   32,588.80 
Subscription upto 2,560 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   37,696.00 
Subscription upto 3,072 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   42,803.20 
Subscription upto 3,584 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   47,910.40 

InsightVM w/Asset Ranges (100% Renewal)



Subscription upto 4,096 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   53,017.60 
Subscription upto 4,608 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   58,124.80 
Subscription upto 5,120 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   62,833.00 
Subscription upto 6,144 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   69,642.60 
Subscription upto 7,168 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   76,452.20 
Subscription upto 8,192 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   83,261.80 
Subscription upto 9,216 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   90,071.40 
Subscription upto 10,240 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $   96,311.00 
Subscription upto 15,360 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $ 118,199.00 
Subscription upto 20,480 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. IVM - INSIGHTVM  $ 139,403.00 
InsightVM Shared Perimeter Security Engine (up 
to 512 assets)

IVMHOS512
 $     2,850.00 

InsightVM Dedicated Perimeter Security Engine IVMHOSD  $   11,400.00 



Additional console tied to InsightVM purchase IVMCONS-ADD  $   14,250.00 

Subscription upto 128 asset range. This includes 
discovery, unlimited scan engines, unlimited 
templates and up to 3 InsightVM Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $     3,040.00 

Subscription upto 256 asset range. This includes 
discovery, unlimited scan engines, unlimited 
templates and up to 3 InsightVM Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $     6,080.00 

Subscription upto 512 asset range. This includes 
discovery, unlimited scan engines, unlimited 
templates and up to 3 InsightVM Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   10,700.80 

Subscription upto 768 asset range. This includes 
discovery, unlimited scan engines, unlimited 
templates and up to 3 InsightVM Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   14,835.20 
Subscription upto 1,024 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   18,969.60 
Subscription upto 1,536 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   25,779.20 
Subscription upto 2,048 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   32,588.80 
Subscription upto 2,560 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   37,696.00 
Subscription upto 3,072 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   42,803.20 
Subscription upto 3,584 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   47,910.40 

Nexpose w/Asset Ranges (100% Renewal)



Subscription upto 4,096 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   53,017.60 
Subscription upto 4,608 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   58,124.80 
Subscription upto 5,120 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   62,833.00 
Subscription upto 6,144 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   69,642.60 
Subscription upto 7,168 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   76,452.20 
Subscription upto 8,192 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   83,261.80 
Subscription upto 9,216 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   90,071.40 
Subscription upto 10,240 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $   96,311.00 
Subscription upto 15,360 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $ 118,199.00 
Subscription upto 20,480 asset range. This 
includes discovery, unlimited scan engines, 
unlimited templates and up to 3 InsightVM 
Consoles. NXENTALLTERM  $ 139,403.00 
Nexpose Shared Perimeter Security Engine (up to 
512 assets)

NXHOS512-TERM
 $     2,850.00 

Nexpose Dedicated Perimeter Security Engine NXHOSD-TERM  $   11,400.00 



Additional console tied to Nexpose purchase NXENTALLCONS-TERM  $   14,250.00 
1 named user with installation on unlimited 
machines; unlimited target IPs; subscription 
price per year

MSPPROSUB
 $   11,400.00 

2 named users with installation on unlimited 
machines; unlimited target IPs;  subscription 
price per year

MSPPROSUB2U
 $   22,800.00 

3 named users with installation on unlimited 
machines;  unlimited target IPs;  subscription 
price per year

MSPPROSUB3U
 $   34,200.00 

4 named users with installation on unlimited 
machines;  unlimited target IPs;  subscription 
price per year

MSPPROSUB4U
 $   45,600.00 

5 named users with installation on unlimited 
machines;  unlimited target IPs;  subscription 
price per year

MSPPROSUB5U
 $   57,000.00 

MANAGED PCI COMPLIANCE ANNUAL 
SUBSCRIPTION (Up to 128 IPS)

MANPCI-CF
 $     4,900.00 

MANAGED EXTERNAL VULNERABILITY 
ASSESSMENT (Up to 128 IPS)

MANEVA
 $     4,900.00 

MANAGED PCI COMPLIANCE ANNUAL 
SUBSCRIPTION (Up to 256 IPs)

MANPCIPRO-CF
 $     7,350.00 

MANAGED EXTERNAL VULNERABILITY 
ASSESSMENT (Up to 256 IPS, No Consulting)

MANEVAPRO
 $     7,350.00 

MANAGED PCI COMPLIANCE ANNUAL 
SUBSCRIPTION (Up to 512 IPs)

MANPCI512-CF
 $     9,800.00 

 MANAGED EXTERNAL VULNERABILITY 
ASSESSMENT (Up to 512 IPS)  

MANEVA512
 $   14,700.00 

MANAGED PCI COMPLIANCE ANNUAL 
SUBSCRIPTION (Up to 1,024 IPs)

MANPCI1024-CF
 $   19,600.00 

MANAGED VM SCANNING - MONTHLY 
SCANNING - 1 YEAR TERM - UP TO 512 IPS
• Console hosting provided by Rapid7
• 1 hour of report consultation Monthly
• Reports of all findings upon completion of 
scheduled scans: 
o Executive Summary
o Technical Details
o Remediation Plan
o Vulnerability Trend Report
o CSV Export
o Access to custom reports

MANVMMTH_512

 $   29,400.00 



MANAGED VM SCANNING - MONTHLY 
SCANNING - 1 YEAR TERM - UP TO 1024 IPS
• Console hosting provided by Rapid7
• 1 hour of report consultation Monthly
• Reports of all findings upon completion of 
scheduled scans: 
o Executive Summary
o Technical Details
o Remediation Plan
o Vulnerability Trend Report
o CSV Export
o Access to custom report

MANVMMTH_1024

 $   39,200.00 

MANAGED VM SCANNING - MONTHLY 
SCANNING - 1 YEAR TERM - UP TO 2500 IPS
• Console hosting provided by Rapid7
• 1 hour of report consultation Monthly
• Reports of all findings upon completion of 
scheduled scans: 
o Executive Summary
o Technical Details
o Remediation Plan
o Vulnerability Trend Report
o CSV Export
o Access to custom report

MANVMMTH_2500

 $   53,900.00 

MANAGED VM SCANNING - QUARTERLY 
SCANNING - 1 YEAR TERM - UP TO 512 IPS
• Console hosting provided by Rapid7
• 1 hour of report consultation Quarterly
• Reports of all findings upon completion of 
scheduled scans: 
o Executive Summary
o Technical Details
o Remediation Plan
o Vulnerability Trend Report
o CSV Export
o Access to custom reports

MANVMQTR_512

 $   19,600.00 



MANAGED VM SCANNING - QUARTERLY 
SCANNING - 1 YEAR TERM - UP TO 1024 IPS
• Console hosting provided by Rapid7
• 1 hour of report consultation Quarterly
• Reports of all findings upon completion of 
scheduled scans: 
o Executive Summary
o Technical Details
o Remediation Plan
o Vulnerability Trend Report
o CSV Export
o Access to custom reports

MANVMQTR_1024

 $   29,400.00 

MANAGED VM SCANNING - QUARTERLY 
SCANNING - 1 YEAR TERM - UP TO 2500 IPS
• Console hosting provided by Rapid7
• 1 hour of report consultation Quarterly
• Reports of all findings upon completion of 
scheduled scans: 
o Executive Summary
o Technical Details
o Remediation Plan
o Vulnerability Trend Report
o CSV Export
o Access to custom reports

MANVMQTR_2500

 $   44,100.00 
RAPID7 SUPER SUPPORT: Premium Support 
Offering including Technical Account Manager, 
Dedicated Support, Quarterly Business Review, 
and Bi-Annual Architectural Review. Price per 
year.  

PREMSUP-SMALL

 $   24,500.00 
RAPID7 SUPER SUPPORT: Premium Support 
Offering including Technical Account Manager, 
Dedicated Support, Quarterly Business Review, 
and Bi-Annual Architectural Review. Price per 
year. 

PREMSUP-MED

 $   49,000.00 
RAPID7 SUPER SUPPORT: Premium Support 
Offering including Technical Account Manager, 
Dedicated Support, Quarterly Business Review, 
Bi-Annual Architectural Review, and Planned 
Onsite Support. Price per year.  

PREMSUP-ENTERPRISE

 $   98,000.00 



RAPID7 SUPER SUPPORT: Premium Support 
Offering including Technical Account Manager, 
Dedicated Support, Quarterly Business Review, 
Bi-Annual Architectural Review, and Planned 
Onsite Support. Price per year. 

PREMSUP-GLOBALENT

 $ 196,000.00 


